

FLORIDA INLAND NAVIGATION DISTRICT
1314 Marcinski Road
Jupiter, FL 33477

MEETING MINUTES
NASSAU REACH 1 DREDGING BID OPENING
JULY 17, 2017

A Public Meeting was held pursuant to Florida Statutes Section 255.0518 on July 17, 2017, 2 p.m. to open bid packages for the NASSAU REACH 1 DREDGING Project. Mark Tamblyn, FIND Field Project Coordinator, called the meeting to order at 2:00 PM.

Those in attendance were: Janet Zimmerman, Assistant Executive Director, FIND; Rocco Cavo, Tina Kleintop and Ivelisse Sabon, Cavache; John Vannoy, Orion Marine Group; Mike Ciabattai, Ferreira Construction; Daniel J. Hassett, Cashman Dredging.

Mr. Tamblyn verified that the bids were received in accordance with the Instructions to Bidders.

Mr. Tamblyn then opened the bid package and read aloud the name of the bid company, as follows:

BID COMPANY: BID / ALTERNATE BIDS: A/B/C

Southwind	\$ 2,600,688.78 /A: \$2,825,412.72/B: \$1,737,091.52/C: \$1,476,918.01
Orion	\$ 3,320,687.00 /A:NO BID/ B: NO BID/C: \$1,141,994.01
Brance	\$ 3,420,000.00 /A: \$1,625,000.00/B: \$1,310,000.00/C: \$1,304,000.00
Cavache	\$ 4,008,400.00 /A: \$1,806,000.00/B: \$1,347,000.00/C: \$1,218,600.00
Ferriera	\$ 4,748,740.00 /A: NO BID/B: NO BID/C: \$1,069,660.50
Cashman	\$ 5,371,200.00 /A: NO BID/B: NO BID/C: \$1,979,450.00

There being no other business, Mr. Tamblyn adjourned the meeting at 2:12 PM.



Mark Tamblyn
Field Projects Coordinator, FIND